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Abstract: This paper explores the ways of integrating practical teaching methods and diversity in 
ideological and political theory courses in universities. Through theoretical analysis and practical 
exploration of practical teaching methods and diversified integration teaching models, combined with 
the characteristics and teaching needs of ideological and political theory courses in universities, a 
teaching strategy and method combining practical teaching methods and diversified integration are 
proposed. Through the use of various teaching methods and resources such as case analysis, discussion 
and interaction, practical experience, and multimedia assistance, the aim is to improve the teaching 
quality of ideological and political theory courses in universities and the cultivation level of students' 
comprehensive literacy, promoting the comprehensive improvement of students' ideological and 
political literacy. 
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1. Introduction 

With the development of the times and changes in society, the teaching of ideological and political 
theory courses in universities is facing new challenges and opportunities. As an important way to 
cultivate students' comprehensive qualities and ideological and political consciousness, ideological and 
political theory courses in universities play an irreplaceable role in shaping students' ideological and 
moral character and enhancing their political literacy[1]. However, traditional teaching models often 
suffer from problems such as a single teaching method application and dull content presentation, which 
makes it difficult to stimulate students' learning interest and critical thinking ability, affecting the 
improvement of teaching effectiveness and the cultivation of students' ideological and political 
awareness. 

In response to the various challenges in the current teaching of ideological and political theory 
courses in universities, this paper aims to explore the diversified integration of practical teaching 
methods, with the goal of enriching classroom teaching methods and improving teaching effectiveness, 
to promote the deepening and improvement of ideological and political theory course teaching in 
universities. Through theoretical analysis of the concept, classification, and application of diversified 
teaching methods in ideological and political courses, combined with specific case studies and 
empirical investigations, this paper attempts to construct a practical teaching method diversified 
integration model that is both in line with the characteristics of ideological and political course teaching 
and can be flexibly applied, providing reference and reference for the teaching reform of ideological 
and political theory courses in universities. 

This paper will discuss the current situation of ideological and political theory teaching in 
universities, the application of diversified teaching methods in ideological and political courses, the 
construction of a diversified integration model of practical teaching methods, and the evaluation and 
optimization of teaching effects. The aim is to provide theoretical support and practical guidance for 
the teaching reform of ideological and political theory courses in universities, and to contribute to the 
cultivation of socialist builders and successors with comprehensive development in morality, 
intelligence, physical fitness, aesthetics, and labor. 
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2. Analysis of the current teaching situation of ideological and political theory courses in 
universities 

2.1 The status and role of ideological and political theory courses in universities 

The ideological and political theory courses in universities play a crucial role in the Chinese higher 
education system, and their status and role are irreplaceable [2]. This course is not only a platform for 
imparting knowledge, but also an important channel for cultivating students' socialist core values, 
strengthening political literacy and ideological character. It shoulders the mission of inheriting and 
developing the Party's ideological theory, and promoting the core socialist values. Through the 
education of ideological and political theory courses in universities, we can guide students to establish 
correct worldviews, outlooks on life, and values, so that they have firm political beliefs and correct 
social concepts. Under the guidance of this course, students' political awareness will be enhanced, their 
sense of social responsibility will be strengthened, and their cultural confidence will also be cultivated. 
The educational goal of ideological and political theory courses is not only to impart knowledge, but 
also to cultivate students' comprehensive development in morality, intelligence, physical fitness, 
aesthetics, and labor. By studying this course, students will not only be theoretical recipients, but also 
practitioners in practice. They will learn to apply their knowledge to practical life and become socialist 
builders and successors. 

Therefore, the importance of ideological and political theory courses in universities cannot be 
ignored. It is not only a course, but also a spiritual inheritance and development, and a key link in 
cultivating builders and successors of socialism with Chinese characteristics in the new era. Only 
through such education can we cultivate socialist builders with comprehensive development in morality, 
intelligence, physical fitness, aesthetics, and labor, and contribute to the prosperity and development of 
the country. 

2.2 Problems in the current teaching of ideological and political theory courses in universities 

The current teaching of ideological and political theory courses in universities is facing a series of 
prominent problems, which urgently need to be solved to improve teaching quality and effectiveness 
[3]. Firstly, some teachers have overly traditional teaching philosophies and single teaching methods, 
resulting in a dull and boring classroom environment. This teaching method is difficult to attract 
students' attention and active participation, which affects the effectiveness of teaching. Teachers need 
to update their teaching philosophy, explore diverse teaching methods, make the classroom more lively 
and attractive, and thus stimulate students' interest and initiative in learning. Secondly, the current 
textbook content and teaching methods are relatively lagging behind, and cannot timely reflect changes 
in social development and student needs. With the continuous progress and development of society, 
new ideological theories and practical experiences continue to emerge, but some textbooks have not 
been updated in a timely manner, leading to a disconnect between course content and the trend of the 
times. Meanwhile, unchanging teaching methods also struggle to meet the diverse learning needs of 
students. Therefore, it is necessary to revise and update the textbooks in a timely manner, explore 
teaching methods that are suitable for the learning characteristics of contemporary college students, and 
improve the pertinence and effectiveness of teaching. Thirdly, some students hold a resistance towards 
ideological and political courses, believing that their teaching content is unrelated to their own majors, 
lacks practicality and targeting, and is difficult to stimulate their interest and motivation in learning. 
These students often hold a negative attitude towards ideological and political courses, lacking 
awareness of their importance, which affects their learning attitude and effectiveness towards the 
course. Therefore, it is necessary to adjust the curriculum and content, increase practical teaching 
content, and make it more closely related to the actual needs and interests of students, thereby 
enhancing their learning motivation and participation. Finally, the current teaching evaluation system 
also has shortcomings, lacking scientific and comprehensive evaluation methods, making it difficult to 
objectively reflect the quality of teaching and the learning situation of students. The traditional 
examination evaluation method often only evaluates students' memory ability and cannot 
comprehensively evaluate their comprehensive ability and quality development. Therefore, it is 
necessary to establish a diversified evaluation system, including classroom performance, homework 
quality, comprehensive abilities, and other aspects, in order to comprehensively and scientifically 
evaluate teaching effectiveness and student learning situation, and provide effective data support for the 
deepening of teaching reform. 

In summary, there are many problems in the current teaching of ideological and political theory 
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courses in universities, which require the joint efforts of teachers, schools, and relevant departments to 
take effective measures to solve. Only by continuously improving teaching methods, updating textbook 
content, adjusting curriculum settings, and establishing a scientifically sound evaluation system, can 
ideological and political courses better play their role in cultivating students' socialist core values and 
political literacy, and make positive contributions to cultivating socialist builders and successors with 
all-round development in morality, intelligence, physical fitness, aesthetics, and labor. 

2.3 Practice and experience of teaching reform of ideological and political theory courses in domestic 
and foreign universities 

In order to solve the problems in the teaching of ideological and political theory courses in 
universities, domestic and foreign universities have carried out a series of teaching reform practices and 
accumulated rich experience. In terms of teaching content, some universities focus on introducing 
cutting-edge ideological and theoretical achievements and practical experience, combined with the 
characteristics and practical needs of students, breaking the traditional teaching paradigm of ideological 
and political courses, and enhancing the pertinence and attractiveness of the courses. In terms of 
teaching methods, some universities have explored the use of diversified teaching methods, such as 
case teaching, interactive teaching, practical teaching, etc., which have stimulated students' learning 
interest and thinking ability, improved teaching effectiveness and student satisfaction. At the same time, 
some universities have also established a scientifically sound teaching evaluation system, which 
objectively reflects the quality of teaching and the learning situation of students through 
multi-dimensional and multi angle evaluation methods, providing an effective feedback mechanism for 
teaching reform. 

3. The application of diversified teaching concepts in ideological and political theory courses in 
universities 

3.1 The connotation and characteristics of diversified teaching concepts 

The concept of diversified teaching highlights the importance of using various teaching methods, 
means, and resources in the teaching process to meet the diverse learning needs and personalized 
learning methods of students. The core of this concept lies in igniting students' thirst for knowledge, 
stimulating their interest and initiative in learning, and thereby improving teaching and learning 
outcomes through diverse teaching strategies and activity designs. The prominent features of 
diversified teaching philosophy include flexibility, inclusiveness, and personalization, emphasizing 
respect for students' differences and individual needs, aiming to cultivate their comprehensive literacy 
and innovation ability, so that they can confidently demonstrate their talents and potential in both 
academic and practical fields. 

3.2 The significance and advantages of diversified teaching concepts in ideological and political 
theory courses in universities 

The application of diverse teaching concepts in the teaching of ideological and political theory 
courses in universities has important significance and significant advantages. Firstly, diversified 
teaching can enrich the content and form of classroom teaching, increase the fun and attractiveness of 
teaching, and improve students' learning enthusiasm and participation. By introducing various teaching 
methods such as case analysis, discussion and interaction, and practical experience, students can have a 
deeper understanding and mastery of ideological and political theory knowledge, and enhance their 
sense of identification and interest in the course. Secondly, diversified teaching is conducive to 
stimulating students' active thinking and innovative abilities, cultivating their critical thinking and 
problem-solving abilities. By conducting various forms of teaching activities such as group discussions, 
mind mapping, and practical research, students can promote communication, cooperation, and collision 
of ideas, expand their horizons and ideas, and improve their ability to analyze and solve problems. 
Once again, diversified teaching can promote students' comprehensive development and 
comprehensive literacy improvement, cultivate their ability for self-directed learning and lifelong 
learning. By organizing students to participate in various forms of practical teaching such as 
ideological and political cultural activities and social practice projects, students can enhance their 
practical abilities and sense of social responsibility, and improve their comprehensive quality and 
competitiveness. 
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3.3 Specific practical methods of diversified teaching concepts in ideological and political theory 
courses in universities 

In the specific practice of ideological and political theory courses in universities, the following 
diverse teaching methods can be adopted to enrich teaching content and form, and improve teaching 
and learning effectiveness. Firstly, case analysis teaching can be conducted to guide students in 
analyzing problems, exploring solutions, and improving their ability to apply theory to practice by 
selecting representative cases. Secondly, discussions and interactive activities can be organized to 
stimulate students' thinking by setting classroom topics and asking questions, promoting 
communication and collision among students, and stimulating their active thinking and innovative 
consciousness. Once again, practical experience teaching can be carried out, organizing students to 
participate in social practice, volunteer service and other activities, so that they can understand the 
connotation and practical significance of ideological and political theory through practical actions. In 
addition, multimedia assisted teaching, gamified teaching and other methods can be used to fully utilize 
modern technological means and teaching resources, enhance the fun and interactivity of teaching, and 
stimulate students' interest and initiative in learning. 

4. Construction of a practical teaching method integration model 

4.1 Overview of practical teaching models 

The practical teaching model represents a teaching paradigm that combines theoretical knowledge 
with practical operations, with practical activities as the main teaching carrier, aiming to cultivate 
students' practical abilities and innovative spirit. Compared with the traditional "indoctrination" 
teaching method, this model pays more attention to students' participation and experience, advocates 
the teaching concept of "learning for application", and is committed to allowing students to constantly 
explore, practice and improve themselves in practice. The core of practical teaching mode lies in 
deepening students' understanding and application of theoretical knowledge through practical operation 
and experience, thereby promoting their comprehensive development and improving their 
comprehensive literacy. In this mode, students are no longer passively receiving knowledge, but 
actively participating in practical activities, deepening their understanding of knowledge through 
personal experience. For example, in science courses, students may conduct experimental operations to 
understand the specific applications of scientific theories; In art courses, students may experience the 
charm and skills of art through creating works. In addition, the practical teaching model also provides 
students with a practical laboratory, allowing them to apply the knowledge they have learned in 
practical scenarios, cultivate problem-solving abilities and innovative thinking. This learning method 
can not only enhance students' hands-on ability, but also stimulate their creativity and imagination, 
enabling them to have stronger comprehensive literacy. In addition, the practical teaching model also 
helps to establish connections between students, society, and industries, promoting their career 
development and social adaptability. By participating in practical activities, students can understand the 
needs and challenges in actual work, and prepare for their future career. Therefore, the practical 
teaching model, as an innovative teaching method, is of great significance for the learning and growth 
of students. It can not only enhance students' learning enthusiasm and autonomy, but also cultivate their 
practical ability and innovative consciousness, laying a solid foundation for their future development. 

4.2 Design principles and construction framework for the integration model of practical teaching 
methods 

The design of the integration mode of practical teaching methods should follow the following 
principles and construct corresponding frameworks. In the process of constructing the framework, 
theory and practice are combined, classroom teaching is combined with practical activities, and 
theoretical knowledge learning and practical operation are mutually integrated to achieve an organic 
combination of theory and practice; We encourage the combination of student participation and teacher 
guidance, emphasize the role of students as the main body, encourage students to actively participate in 
practical activities, and at the same time, teachers should play a guiding and guiding role to promote 
students' independent learning and self-improvement; We use various teaching methods and resources 
such as case analysis, discussion and interaction, practical experience, and multimedia assistance, 
combined with diverse teaching methods and resources, to enrich teaching content and form, and 
improve teaching effectiveness; Combining assessment with ability development, adopting diverse 
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assessment and evaluation methods, emphasizing the cultivation and improvement of students' abilities 
and qualities, this not only emphasizes the mastery and understanding of knowledge, but also 
emphasizes the cultivation of practical ability and innovative consciousness. 

4.3 Application example analysis of the integration model of practical teaching method in ideological 
and political theory courses in universities 

Taking ideological and political theory courses in universities as an example, a practical teaching 
method integration model can be adopted for teaching design and implementation. The specific practice 
includes the following aspects: case analysis, selecting typical cases related to ideological and political 
theory, guiding students to analyze the ideological and political problems behind the cases, exploring 
solutions, and proposing personal opinions and viewpoints; Discuss and interact, organize students to 
participate in classroom discussions, set up topics related to ideological and political theory, encourage 
students to discuss their own opinions and thoughts, stimulate their active thinking and innovative 
consciousness; Practice experience, organize students to participate in ideological and political cultural 
activities, social practice projects and other practical activities, so that they can understand the 
connotation and practical significance of ideological and political theory through actual participation, 
enhance their sense of social responsibility and civic consciousness; Multimedia assistance, utilizing 
multimedia technology to assist teaching, showcasing images, videos, literature materials related to 
ideological and political theory, enriching teaching content and forms, and enhancing students' interest 
and participation in learning. 

The application of the above practical teaching method integration model can promote the teaching 
reform and improve the quality of ideological and political theory courses in universities, cultivate 
students' comprehensive qualities and innovative abilities, and lay a good foundation for them to 
become socialist builders and successors with comprehensive development in morality, intelligence, 
physical fitness, aesthetics, and labor. 

5. Conclusion 

The exploration of the diversified integration of practical teaching methods in ideological and 
political theory courses in universities is an important teaching reform exploration. By exploring the 
integration of practical teaching methods and diverse approaches, the teaching quality of ideological 
and political theory courses in universities and the cultivation of students' comprehensive literacy can 
be effectively improved. The application of practical teaching methods has injected new vitality into 
ideological and political theory courses in universities. The traditional theoretical indoctrination 
teaching model is difficult to stimulate students' interest and initiative in learning, while the application 
of practical teaching methods can enable students to deeply understand and apply the theoretical 
knowledge they have learned by participating in practical operations and experiential activities, thereby 
improving the effectiveness and quality of learning. The diverse and integrated teaching methods 
enrich the teaching content and form of ideological and political theory courses. In a diversified and 
integrated teaching mode, teachers can use various teaching methods and resources, such as case 
analysis, discussion and interaction, practical experience, multimedia assistance, etc., to enrich teaching 
content and form, meet the learning needs and interests of different students, and improve teaching 
flexibility and pertinence. The combination of practical teaching methods and diversified integration 
promotes the comprehensive improvement of students' ideological and political literacy. Through the 
participation of practical activities and the application of diverse teaching methods, students can not 
only deeply understand and apply ideological and political theory knowledge, but also cultivate critical 
thinking, innovative consciousness, and practical ability, improve their comprehensive literacy and 
social responsibility, and lay a good foundation for becoming socialist builders and successors with 
comprehensive development in morality, intelligence, physical fitness, aesthetics, and labor. The 
exploration of the diversified integration of practical teaching methods in ideological and political 
theory courses in universities requires continuous exploration and improvement. Teachers should 
continuously summarize their experiences in teaching practice, actively explore practical teaching 
models and diverse integration methods suitable for their respective majors and courses, continuously 
improve their teaching level and quality, and make greater contributions to cultivating socialist builders 
and successors. 
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